
CONTACT US

WWW.EXAEQUO.NET/OXILI

514 288-3852 EXT. 227 OR 224

INFO@OXILI.NET

3680 JEANNE-MANCE STREET, 
SUITE 328

LE SERVICE OXILI AU QUOTIDIEN IS MADE 
POSSIBLE BY:

SELF-MANAGEMENT 
MADE EASY

A service offered by:

Offers a pairing between self-
managers, people needing home 
support with the use of the Service 
Employment Paycheque, and those 
registered on our reference list who 
are authorized to offer home support.

• Offered on the territory of the Island 
of Montreal
• Intended for people with a motor 
deficiency, for families with children 
with an impairment or for people over 
65 with diminishing autonomy who 
received the Service Employment 
Paycheque modality

THIS FREE AND 
BILINGUAL 
SERVICE IS:

LE SERVICE
OXILI
AU QUOTIDIEN



• Obtain the Service Employment 
Paycheque modality from your 
counselor, with a confirmed number 
of hours
• Contact us by phone to open a file

• Benefit from support in your search 
for attendants 
• Take advantage of the possibility of 
doing your own online research; the 
Daily Oxili Service provides you with 
a database allowing you to search for 
people qualified to offer home support 
and who correspond to your needs!

• Our information workshops about 
your rights and responsibilities 
• Discussion groups and 
opportunities to interact with other 
self-managers
• A reference service

• Hire, train, coordinate, and, if 
necessary, fire the staff
• Fill out the “Social Component” form 
so that the attendant can be paid by 
the Service Employment Paycheque 
Processing Center
• Exercise your role as an employer 
by following your legal obligations

• To select trustworthy attendants 
with a variety of skills and experience
• To check the criminal records and 
professional references of the 
attendants
• To guide self-managers and 
attendants in their searches

Would you like to offer 
your services as 
attendants?
Contact us by phone or 
send us your resume 
(CV) by email. 

The Service Employment Paycheque 
modality is a way to self-manage your 
home support services, allowing you 
to decide when you will receive them 
and who will offer them to you! 

BECOME A 
SELF-MANAGER

WHERE TO START?

AND THEN WHAT?

WHAT IS YOUR ROLE?

WHAT IS OUR ROLE?

USING LE SERVICE 
OXILI AU 
QUOTIDIEN ALSO 
GIVES YOU ACCESS TO:
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